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MEMORANDUM
APR 0.7 2011

To: Clerk, Wisconsin Supreme Court CLERK OF SUPREME COURT
OF WISCONSIN

From: Adam Korbitz
Government Relations Coordinator
State Bar of Wisconsin

Date:  April 7,2011

Re: Supplemental information regarding Petition 10-10

Attorney Lindsey Draper, who will be appearing for petitioner Deb Smith, has asked that I file
the attached documents with the court regarding Petition 10-10, which is scheduled for hearing
on Monday, April 11, 2011. The first attachment is a chart that details two fiscal years of
payments, denials and deferred payments; the second attachment consists of thank-you notes
from claimants the fund has helped.
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Fiscal Year 2010 July 1, 2009 - June 30, 2010
Fiscal Year 2011 June 1, 2010 - June 30, 2011

FY 10 Meeting Dates S's Approved S$'s Denied S$'s Deferred to FY 11
8/18/2009 $294,147 (13 claims) $69,282 (nine claims) N/A
11/7/2009 $182,900 (seven claims) $140,888 (10 claims) N/A
5/11/2010 * $36,450 (eight claims) $103,800 (nine claims) $374,894 ( eight claims)

FY 11 Meeting Dates S$'s Approved $'s Denied S's Deferred to FY 12
8/24/2010 $186,224 (22 claims) $597,754 (11 claims) N/A
11/2/2010 $32,250 (seven claims) $2,786,800 (six claims) N/A
3/15/2011 $90,022 (11 claims) $685,999 (18 claims) $195,400 (seven claims)

* Two of the claims approved for reimbursement had to be paid after July 1, 2010 because the Fund had to
wait for assessments to be paid for Fiscal Year 2011. The two claims totaled $8,750

As of April 5, 2011, there are four new claims to be considered at the first meeting in Fiscal Year 2012

totaling $210,178 in reimbursement requests.
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APR 07 2011
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Kris Wenzel

From: Teri Johnson [teresalynn55@hotmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2011 6:32 PM

To: Kris Wenzel

Subject: Alf Langan.

Dear Ms. Wenzel: Just a short note to let you know that we faxed the paperwork that you sent us, and also I am mailing
the originals.

Thank you for all of your help in this matter. We are so happy to get our money back and it will help us catch up our
house payments.

If we can help in any other way, please feel free to contact us.

I can only hope that Mr. Langan, someday, realizes the total mess he has made out of our fives, while he goes on as if he

has not a care in the world.
Again, thank you. We will be eternally grateful for all you have done for us.

Sincerely.

Larry and Teri Johnson
608-783-1550

N5436 Abbey Road
Onalaska, Wisconsin

-

3/18/2011 7:22 AM 1
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SWIKCICHOWSKI

729 Karcz Dr. Apt. 4
Pulaski, WI. 54162
- (920) 373~2201
Sunday, September 3, 2006
E-mail: Switchy44@yahoo.com

The State Bar of Wisconsin

Wisconsin Lawyers’ Fund for Client Protection
P.0.Box 7158
Madison, Wi 53707~7458

Dear Kris Wenzel,
(Client Protection Fund Administrator)
File# 06-109

I thank you much for the consideration of this matter. | also thank and respect the
lawyers that support this program along with your committee. | have received the
reimbursement of the total amount of $1,500. Once again, | thank all the persons that
had been involved on this issue. Your committee appears to be well organized and |
would be honored to work under a department with such standards Keep up the good
work Kris. Thank You!

Sincerely,

W/W

Chad J. Swiecichowski




August 28, 2005

Knis Wenzel, Administraton
WLFCP

P.0. Box 7158

Madison, WI 53707-7158

Dean Ms. Wenzel:

1 believe it is fain Zo say, thexe is no undoing the hawm of Zhe pro-
mises of Atty. Ham and his Lack of follow through. My Life would have been
different if he had followed through and had been successful.

The sitven Lining comes in the actions o4 the WLFCP in rnecignizing
the wiong and providing me with the settlement in the amount 1 had stated
was due. I would Like %o thank you forn all of yowr help and all of the peo-
ple on the committee fon thein decisions.

I§ this matten is punsued in count 1 am at yowr dispossal if needed.

Thank you again.

Sincenely,
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August 19, 2005
Rebecca Horien

187 1/2 E. 1st Street
Fond du Lac, WI 54935

Kris Wenzel, Administrator, Wisconsin Lawyers’ Fund for Client Protection
State Bar of Wisconsin

5302 Eastpark Bivd.

- P.O.Box 7158

Madison, Wisconsin 53707-7158

Déaf Kris Wenzel,
| received my letter today, informing me that ihe WLFCP approved my claim.

I want to express the deep gratitude that | feel, and thank you for the information
you provided, the time you spent on my case, the caring expressed, and the
efficiency in providing the forms and information needed in the small window of
time that we had available before the deadline. | feel so relieved and happy.

I have learned much in this experience. If 1 ever need a lawyer again, | will be
cautious and make certain that | have a viable referral to go on.

1 would hope that Attorney Fadner would refund my money, and | would joyfully
send it to you for this fund if he would do so. Sadly, | have little hope of that
happening. | do not possess the legal knowledge or the power to-pursue this
matter, so thank the kind spirit of the WLFCP for the help.

| feel embarrassed that | had hired such an attomey to begin with, and that | was
bailed out through the caring of others that had no fault in this matter.

It is my sincere hope that the Fund can recover this money. If you need my help
in any way, | will be most happy to do anything that | can.

Kris, | think you were the person who told me that | was not the first client of Mr.
Fadner’s to go through this process. | did file a grievance against him through the
Office of Lawyer Regulation in Madison. He truly had a negative effect on a case
that involved not only myself, but others as well, and | worked so hard on it for
such a long time. If anyone else can be spared this kind of ordeal, and your fund
further claims, it will be worth it. It is the one thing | could do. If you can think of
anything else, | am here.

- Sincerely, N
' 3@4«/\_] QL'? N &\

Rebecca Horien
Home: (920) 273-0829 Cell: (920) 948-9738 email: rhorien@mac.com



